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DESCRIPTION
Bruxism, commonly known as teeth grinding or clenching, is a 
condition in which individuals grind or clench their teeth 
unconsciously. This can happen during sleep, known as sleep 
bruxism, or while awake, referred to as awake bruxism. While 
occasional teeth grinding might not be harmful, frequent 
bruxism can lead to serious dental and health issues. 
Understanding the causes, symptoms, and treatment options for 
bruxism is essential for preventing long-term damage and 
maintaining oral health.

Bruxism

Bruxism is characterized by the grinding, clenching, or gnashing 
of teeth. This condition can occur during the day (awake 
bruxism) or at night during sleep (sleep bruxism). While awake 
bruxism is often associated with stress or anxiety, sleep bruxism 
is classified as a sleep-related movement disorder, meaning that 
those who grind their teeth while asleep may also experience 
other sleep disorders, such as snoring or sleep apnea.

Causes of bruxism

The exact cause of bruxism is not fully understood, but several 
factors are believed to contribute to the condition:

Stress and anxiety: Emotional stress, anxiety, frustration, or 
anger are common triggers for both awake and sleep bruxism. 
People experiencing high levels of stress may unconsciously 
clench or grind their teeth as a way of coping with emotional 
tension.

Sleep disorders: Sleep bruxism is often linked to other sleep 
disorders, such as Obstructive Sleep Apnea (OSA), a condition in 
which breathing repeatedly stops and starts during sleep. 
Individuals with OSA are more likely to experience teeth 
grinding.

Medications and substances: Certain medications, particularly 
those that affect the central nervous system, such as 
antidepressants and psychotropic drugs, may increase the risk of 

bruxism. The use of substances like caffeine, alcohol, and 
tobacco has also been associated with teeth grinding.

Personality traits: People with aggressive, competitive, or 
hyperactive personalities may be more prone to bruxism. High 
levels of energy and stress can cause these individuals to grind 
their teeth more frequently.

Misaligned teeth: In some cases, bruxism can result from bite 
alignment problems, such as an overbite or under bite. When 
the teeth do not fit together properly, it can lead to grinding and 
clenching.

Genetics: There is evidence that bruxism can run in families. If a 
person has a family history of teeth grinding, they may be more 
likely to experience the condition.

Symptoms of bruxism

Bruxism can have several symptoms, ranging from mild to severe. 
Common signs and symptoms of teeth grinding include:

Jaw pain or soreness: Bruxism often causes discomfort or pain in 
the jaw muscles. In severe cases, it may lead to 
Temporomandibular Joint (TMJ) disorders, which cause pain in 
the jaw joint and surrounding muscles.

Facial pain: Over time, bruxism can cause discomfort or pain in 
the facial muscles due to the strain of constant grinding or 
clenching.

Sleep disruption: Individuals with sleep bruxism may experience 
poor sleep quality, as the grinding can disturb their sleep cycles 
or contribute to other sleep disorders, such as sleep apnea.

Treatment of bruxism

While there is no cure for bruxism, several treatment options 
can help manage the condition and prevent further damage:

Stress management: Since stress and anxiety are significant 
contributors to bruxism, stress management techniques such as 
relaxation exercises, meditation, and Cognitive-Behavioral 
Therapy (CBT) can help reduce the frequency and severity of 
teeth grinding.
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early and seeking appropriate treatment can help prevent long-
term damage to the teeth and jaw. Stress management, dental 
appliances, and behavioral therapy are among the effective ways 
to manage bruxism and improve oral health. By addressing the 
underlying causes and symptoms, individuals with bruxism can 
reduce the impact of teeth grinding on their overall well-being.
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Medication: In some cases, muscle relaxants may be prescribed 
to reduce jaw muscle activity during sleep. Additionally, if 
bruxism is linked to anxiety or sleep disorders, medications such 
as antidepressants or anti-anxiety drugs may be recommended.

Behavioral therapy: For those with awake bruxism, behavioral 
therapy can help individuals become more aware of their teeth-
grinding habits during the day. Techniques such as biofeedback 
can be used to train the patient to relax their jaw muscles and 
avoid clenching.

CONCLUSION
Bruxism is a common condition that, if left untreated, can lead 
to significant dental and health issues. Recognizing the symptoms
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