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DESCRIPTION
Firearm wounds represent a significant challenge in emergency 
medicine, characterized by complex injuries that often require 
immediate and specialized intervention. The management of 
these injuries involves a range of disciplines, from initial pre-
hospital care to comprehensive hospital-based treatment. 
Effective management strategies focus not only to stabilize 
patients but also to manage complications such as infection and 
long-term disability. This  study  outlines the critical  components 
of managing firearm wounds, highlighting the importance of 
prompt assessment, precise surgical techniques and ongoing 
rehabilitation for optimal patient outcomes.

Pre-hospital management

Immediate actions in the field significantly impact patient 
survival and recovery. First responders should prioritize scene 
safety before approaching the injured individual. Upon reaching 
the patient, rapid assessment and basic life support measures, 
such as controlling bleeding with direct pressure or tourniquets, 
are essential. Airway management and stabilization of vital signs 
should be addressed promptly to prevent further deterioration 
during transport.

Initial assessment in the emergency department

Upon arrival at the hospital, the trauma team initiates a 
systematic approach to firearm wound management. Primary 
survey following Advanced Trauma Life Support (ATLS) 
protocols helps identify and address life-threatening injuries first. 
Airway patency, breathing adequacy, circulation status and 
disability assessment (neurological status) are promptly checked 
and managed.

Wound management strategies

The management of firearm wounds depends on various factors, 
including wound location, trajectory and associated injuries. 
Principles    of    wound    care   involve    careful    cleaning   and  
debridement to prevent infection and remove foreign bodies. 

damage, necessitating surgical exploration to assess internal 
injuries accurately.

Orthopedic considerations

Orthopedic injuries from firearm wounds require specialized 
management. Fractures associated with gunshot wounds may be 
complex, often requiring surgical stabilization to restore limb 
function and prevent complications such as compartment 
syndrome or vascular compromise.

Vascular injuries

Gunshot wounds can cause significant vascular trauma, leading 
to hemorrhage and potential limb ischemia. Rapid identification 
and management of vascular injuries are critical to preserve limb 
viability and prevent exsanguination. Vascular surgery 
consultation may be necessary for definitive management, 
including vascular repair or ligation.

Neurosurgical interventions

Firearm wounds involving the head or spine require immediate 
neurosurgical evaluation. Intracranial pressure monitoring, 
neuroimaging studies and surgical intervention may be necessary 
to manage intracranial hemorrhage, relieve pressure and 
minimize neurological deficits.

Infection control and antibiotic prophylaxis

Due to the high risk of infection from firearm wounds, 
prophylactic antibiotics are often administered. Appropriate 
selection based on wound characteristics and local antibiogram 
guidelines helps reduce the incidence of wound infections, 
which can significantly impact recovery and outcomes.

Psychosocial support

Managing firearm wounds extends beyond physical trauma, 
involving psychological and emotional aspects. Patients and their 
families may experience significant emotional distress and 
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High-velocity  gunshot  wounds  often  result  in  extensive  tissue require support  from mental  health professionals. Social services

 DOI: 

mailto:jorge.garcia@edu.ch


specialists, neurosurgeons and other healthcare professionals. 
Rapid assessment, effective wound care and prompt surgical 
intervention are vital in minimizing mortality and morbidity. 
Collaboration among trauma surgeons, orthopedic specialists, 
neurosurgeons and other healthcare providers ensures 
comprehensive treatment customized to each patient's specific 

comprehensive rehabilitation contribute to improved patient 
outcomes and quality of life. Focus on infection control, 
psychological support and long-term care planning helps in 
thorough management of patients affected by firearm injuries. 
Continued studies and education are essential to further advance 
treatment strategies and optimize outcomes.
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can assist with rehabilitation and long-term care planning for 
patients with permanent disabilities.

Rehabilitation and long-term care

Recovery from firearm wounds involves extensive rehabilitation 
to restore function and mobility. Physical and occupational 
therapy are essential components of comprehensive care plans to 
maximize independence and quality of life post-injury. Long-
term monitoring for complications, such as chronic pain or Post-
Traumatic Stress Disorder (PTSD), is important for ongoing 
management.

CONCLUSION
Effective management of firearm wounds requires a 
multidisciplinary approach, involving trauma surgeons, orthopedic
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injuries.  Timely  intervention,  careful  surgical  techniques  and 
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