
Prevention and Management of Exit-Site Infections in Peritoneal Dialysis

Jeffrey Perl*

Department of Medicine, St. Michael’s Hospital, Toronto, Ontario, Canada

DESCRIPTION
Exit-Site Infections (ESIs) are common complications in 
Peritoneal Dialysis (PD) patients, contributing to morbidity, 
technique failure, and hospitalizations. Despite advances in 
infection prevention and management, ESIs remain a significant 
challenge in PD therapy. ESIs are one of the most common 
infectious complications in PD, occurring in up to 20% of 
patients. These infections manifest as erythema, tenderness, 
purulent discharge, and systemic symptoms. Recurrent or 
persistent ESIs can lead to Catheter-Related Bloodstream 
Infections (CRBSIs) and peritonitis, compromising patient 
outcomes and increasing healthcare costs.

Prevention strategies

Catheter placement: Proper catheter insertion techniques and 
site selection are essential to minimize ESI risk. Surgeons should 
adhere to sterile protocols, use antibiotic prophylaxis, and 
consider tunneling techniques to reduce bacterial colonization.

Exit-Site care: Regular exit-site care with antiseptic solutions, 
such as chlorhexidine or povidone-iodine, is crucial for infection 
prevention. Patients should receive education on proper hygiene 
practices, including handwashing and exit-site cleansing 
techniques.

Antibiotic prophylaxis: Topical antibiotic ointments, such as 
mupirocin or neomycin, may be used prophylactically to reduce 
bacterial colonization at the exit site. However, concerns about 
antibiotic resistance and allergic reactions necessitate judicious 
use.

Catheter securement: Securement devices help stabilize the 
catheter and reduce mechanical trauma to the exit site. Proper 
dressing techniques and regular assessment of catheter stability 
are essential to prevent dislodgement and infection.

Patient education: Patient education plays a crucial role in ESI 
prevention. Healthcare providers should educate patients on 
recognizing signs of infection, proper exit-site care, and when to 
seek medical attention.

Management strategies

Early recognition: Prompt recognition and diagnosis of ESIs 
are essential for timely intervention. Healthcare providers should 
evaluate exit sites regularly and initiate treatment at the first 
signs of infection.

Empirical antibiotic therapy: Empirical antibiotic therapy 
should cover common pathogens associated with ESIs, including 
Staphylococcus aureus and coagulase-negative staphylococci. 
Oral antibiotics are often sufficient for mild infections, while 
severe cases may require intravenous antibiotics and 
hospitalization.

Catheter removal: In cases of refractory or recurrent ESIs, 
catheter removal may be necessary to prevent further 
complications, such as CRBSIs and peritonitis. Timely catheter 
removal and insertion of a new catheter can help preserve 
peritoneal membrane function and prevent systemic infections.

Wound care: Proper wound care, including drainage and 
debridement of purulent discharge, is essential for ESI 
management. Wound cultures should be obtained to guide 
antibiotic selection and assess bacterial susceptibility.

Follow-Up and surveillance: Close follow-up and surveillance 
are critical to monitor treatment response, detect complications, 
and prevent recurrence of ESIs. Healthcare providers should 
assess exit sites regularly and educate patients on the importance 
of adherence to treatment regimens and follow-up 
appointments.

Challenges and future directions

Antibiotic resistance: The emergence of antibiotic-resistant 
bacteria poses a significant challenge to ESI management. Future 
research should focus on developing alternative antimicrobial 
agents, such as antimicrobial peptides or bacteriophages, to 
combat resistant pathogens.

Biofilm formation: Biofilm formation on catheter surfaces 
contributes to ESI recurrence and treatment failure. Novel 
strategies to prevent biofilm formation, such as antimicrobial 
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coatings or catheter modifications, warrant further investigation.

Immunomodulatory therapies: Immunomodulatory agents, 
such as topical immunoglobulins or cytokine inhibitors, may 
enhance host immune responses and reduce ESI risk. Clinical 
trials evaluating the efficacy and safety of these therapies in PD 
patients are needed.

Telemedicine and remote monitoring: Telemedicine platforms 
and remote monitoring devices offer opportunities for early 
detection and intervention in PD patients with ESIs. Integration 
of telehealth services into routine care may improve access to 
healthcare resources and enhance patient outcomes.

CONCLUSION
ESIs are significant complications in PD patients, requiring a 
multifaceted approach to prevention and management. Current 
strategies focus on catheter placement, exit-site care, antibiotic 
prophylaxis, and patient education. Challenges such as 
antibiotic resistance and biofilm formation necessitate 
innovative approaches, including immunomodulatory therapies 
and telemedicine. Future research should prioritize the 
development of alternative antimicrobial agents and strategies to 
prevent biofilm formation, ultimately improving outcomes for 
PD patients with ESIs.
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