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DESCRIPTION
Alcohol Use Disorder (AUD) is a chronic condition 
characterized by the excessive and compulsive consumption of 
alcohol, leading to physical and psychological dependence. It is 
essential to recognize and understand the risks associated with 
AUD to raise awareness, promote prevention, and encourage 
early intervention. This note aims to explore the various risks 
and consequences of alcohol use disorder on physical health, 
mental well-being, and social functioning.

Physical health risks

Liver damage: One of the most well-known risks of AUD is liver 
damage. Prolonged and excessive alcohol consumption can lead 
to conditions like alcoholic hepatitis, fatty liver disease, and 
cirrhosis, which can ultimately result in liver failure [1].

Cardiovascular complications: AUD increases the risk of 
developing cardiovascular diseases, including high blood 
pressure, irregular heart rhythm, heart attacks, and strokes. 
Chronic alcohol abuse weakens the heart muscle, leading to 
cardiomyopathy and an increased likelihood of heart failure.

Gastrointestinal issues: Alcohol irritates the lining of the 
digestive system, leading to conditions like gastritis, ulcers, and 
gastrointestinal bleeding. AUD is also associated with an 
increased risk of pancreatitis, a painful inflammation of the 
pancreas [2].

Increased cancer risk: Long-term alcohol abuse is a significant 
risk factor for several types of cancer, including liver, mouth, 
throat, esophageal, colorectal and breast cancer. The risk 
increases with higher levels of alcohol consumption.

Mental health risks

Depression and anxiety: Alcohol use disorder often co-occurs 
with mental health disorders like depression and anxiety. While 
alcohol may temporarily alleviate symptoms, it exacerbates these 
conditions in the long run [3]. AUD can interfere with the 
effectiveness of mental health treatments and impede the 
recovery process.

Cognitive impairment: Chronic alcohol abuse can lead to 
cognitive impairments, including memory problems, difficulty 
concentrating, and impaired decision-making abilities. It may 
also increase the risk of developing neurological disorders like 
dementia and Wernicke-Korsakoff syndrome [4].

Increased suicidal thoughts and behaviors: Individuals with 
AUD are at a higher risk of experiencing suicidal thoughts and 
engaging in self-harm or suicide attempts. Alcohol's depressive 
effects, coupled with impaired judgment and impulsivity, can 
contribute to these behaviours.

Social and interpersonal risks

Legal issues: Alcohol-related behaviours, such as Driving 
Under the Influence (DUI), public intoxication, and 
violence, can result in legal consequences, including 
arrests, fines, and imprisonment [5]. Legal issues further 
compound the challenges faced by individuals with AUD.

Occupational and financial consequences: Alcohol abuse can 
negatively impact work performance, leading to absenteeism, 
reduced productivity, and even job loss. Financial stability may 
also be compromised due to increased spending on alcohol and 
the inability to meet financial obligations.

Accidents and injuries: Impaired judgment and coordination 
associated with AUD increase the risk of accidents and injuries. 
Alcohol-related accidents, such as falls, motor vehicle crashes, 
and violence, can have severe physical and legal ramifications.

CONCLUSION
AUD poses significant risks to physical health, mental well-
being, and social functioning. Recognizing these risks is crucial 
in addressing AUD, promoting prevention efforts, and providing 
appropriate treatment and support. Early intervention, access to 
comprehensive treatment programs, and on-going support can 
help individuals overcome the challenges of AUD and improve 
their overall quality of life.
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