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ABOUT THE STUDY
Global   health  is  a  multidisciplinary   field   that  surround  the 
health and well-being of populations across the world, 
transcending national boundaries. It involves the study, research, 
and practice of improving health, preventing disease, and 
ensuring equitable access to healthcare for all individuals, 
regardless of where they live. The field of global health is 
inherently complex and dynamic, requiring collaboration across 
diverse sectors, including healthcare, economics, politics, and 
social sciences.

Key players in global health

Several organizations and entities play important  roles in the 
field of global health. These include international organizations 
such as the WHO, UNICEF, and the World Bank, as well as Non-
Governmental Organizations (NGOs), academic institutions, and 
private sector entities [1].

The WHO remains a central figure in global health, providing 
leadership on global health matters, shaping the research 
agenda, setting norms and standards, articulating evidence-based 
policy options, providing technical support to countries, and 
monitoring and assessing health trends.

UNICEF focuses on the health and well-being of children and 
mothers, working to improve nutrition, immunization coverage, 
and access to clean water and sanitation. The world bank, 
through its funding and policy advice, supports health system 
strengthening and the scaling up of necessity health services [2].

NGOs such as Médecins Sans Frontières (Doctors Without 
Borders), the Bill and Melinda Gates Foundation, and the 
Global Fund to Fight AIDS, Tuberculosis, and Malaria play 
significant roles in providing healthcare services, funding 
research, and implementing health programs in resource-limited 
settings [3].

Global health initiatives

Numerous global health initiatives have been launched to 
address specific health challenges. The Global Polio Eradication 
Initiative  (GPEI),  for  example,  has made  significant  strides  in

reducing the incidence of polio worldwide through mass 
vaccination campaigns [4]. Similarly, the President's Emergency 
Plan For AIDS Relief (PEPFAR) has provided substantial 
resources to combat HIV/AIDS in heavily affected countries [5].

The Global Alliance for Vaccines and Immunization (GAVI) is 
another critical initiative that has increased access to 
immunization in low-income countries, preventing millions of 
deaths from vaccine-preventable diseases. The roll back malaria 
partnership and the stop TB partnership are other examples of 
collaborative efforts aimed at controlling and eventually 
eliminating major infectious diseases [6].

Emerging health threats

The field of global health must continually adapt to emerging 
health threats. The COVID-19 pandemic has underscored the 
importance of global cooperation and robust health systems in 
managing health crises. It has highlighted the need for rapid 
response mechanisms, transparent information sharing, and 
equitable access to healthcare resources, including vaccines.

Antimicrobial Resistance (AMR) is another growing threat that 
poses significant challenges to global health. The misuse and 
overuse of antibiotics and other antimicrobial agents have led to 
the emergence of resistant strains of bacteria, viruses, and 
parasites, making infections harder to treat and increasing the 
risk of disease spread, severe illness, and death [7,8].

Health systems strengthening

Strengthening health systems is necessity for achieving 
sustainable improvements in health outcomes. A strong health 
system ensures that all people have access to necessity health 
services without facing financial hardship. It requires effective 
governance, adequate financing, a well-trained and motivated 
health workforce, reliable information systems, access to necessity 
medicines and technologies, and quality service delivery [9].

Health systems strengthening involves a range of activities, from 
building healthcare infrastructure and training healthcare 
workers to improving supply chain management and enhancing 
health information systems.
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challenges and achieving sustainable  health improvements. This 
includes training healthcare workers, strengthening health 
education programs, and developing leadership and management 
skills [3].

Academic institutions play a vital role in global health education 
by conducting research, providing training programs, and 
fostering international collaborations. Universities and research 
institutions in high-income countries often partner with 
counterparts in low-and middle-income countries to build 
capacity and address global health challenges.

Global health is a multifaceted field that requires a 
comprehensive and coordinated approach to address health 
challenges and improve health outcomes worldwide [5]. It 
involves a wide range of activities, from disease prevention and 
health promotion to health systems strengthening and policy 
advocacy. lead in global health, including international 
organizations, NGOs, academic institutions, and the private 
sector, must work together to achieve common goals.
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Health equity and social justice

These are fundamental principles in global health. Health equity 
refers to the absence of unfair and avoidable differences in 
health among different population groups. Achieving health 
equity requires addressing social determinants of health, such as 
education, employment, housing, and access to healthcare.

Social justice in global health means ensuring that all 
individuals, regardless of their socioeconomic status, race, 
gender, or geographic location, have the opportunity to achieve 
their highest possible standard of health. This involves tackling 
structural inequalities and ensuring that marginalized and 
vulnerable populations are not left behind [10].

Innovation and technology

Plays important  roles in advancing global health. Technological 
advancements have led to the development of new diagnostics, 
treatments, and vaccines that have significantly improved health 
outcomes. Mobile Health (mHealth) technologies, for example, 
have revolutionized healthcare delivery by providing remote 
health services, health education, and disease monitoring [10].

Telemedicine has expanded access to healthcare services, 
particularly in remote and underserved areas, by allowing patients 
to consult with healthcare providers via video conferencing. 
Digital health platforms have enhanced disease surveillance and 
data collection, enabling more effective responses to health 
emergencies.

The development of new medical technologies, such as gene 
editing and personalized medicine, holds promise for treating 
and preventing diseases in more targeted and effective ways

Global health governance

Effective global health governance is necessity for coordinating 
and managing international health efforts. Global health 
governance involves the processes and institutions through 
which health policies are formulated, implemented, and 
monitored at the global level. It requires collaboration among 
various stakeholders, including governments, international 
organizations, NGOs, the private sector, and civil society [2].

The WHO plays a central role in global health governance by 
setting international health standards, providing technical 
assistance to countries, and facilitating global health initiatives.

Education and capacity building

These are critical components of global health. Building the 
capacity of health professionals and institutions in low- and 
middle-income  countries  is  necessity  for  addressing  health 
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