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DESCRIPTION
Antiretroviral Therapy (ART) has transformed the landscape of 
HIV/AIDS treatment globally, offering a lifeline to millions of 
individuals by suppressing viral replication, restoring immune 
function, and improving overall quality of life. However, the 
implementation and sustainability of ART in resource-limited 
settings present multifaceted challenges that must be addressed 
to ensure equitable access and optimal health outcomes for all 
affected populations. In resource-limited settings, the provision 
of ART is often hindered by a complex exchange of 
socioeconomic, infrastructural, and healthcare system barriers. 
These settings typically face constrained financial resources, 
inadequate healthcare infrastructure, shortages of trained 
personnel, and logistical challenges in drug procurement, 
distribution, and monitoring. The burden of HIV/AIDS 
disproportionately affects Low- And Middle-Income Countries 
(LMICs), where the prevalence of the disease is often highest and 
resources are scarcest. One of the primary challenges in resource-
limited settings is the limited healthcare infrastructure. Many 
regions lack sufficient clinics, laboratories, and healthcare 
professionals trained in HIV management. This shortage not 
only affects the capacity to diagnose and initiate ART but also 
compromises ongoing monitoring and management of treatment 
outcomes. The decentralization of HIV care to community 
health centers and task-shifting to non-physician healthcare 
workers have been pivotal strategies to alleviate this burden, 
improving accessibility and retention in care. Economic barriers 
further exacerbate the challenges of ART delivery in resource-
limited settings. The cost of Antiretroviral Drugs (ARVs) and 
associated healthcare services can be prohibitive for both 
individuals and healthcare systems. While international donors 
and partnerships have played crucial roles in subsidizing drug 
costs and supporting programmatic initiatives, sustainability 
remains a pressing concern. Efforts to negotiate lower drug 
prices, promote the use of generic alternatives, and strengthen 
health financing mechanisms are essential to ensure long-term 
affordability and accessibility of ART.

Stigma and discrimination continue to pose significant barriers 
to ART uptake and adherence in many communities. The fear of 
social ostracization, loss of employment, or rejection by family 
members often deters individuals from seeking HIV testing and 
treatment. Addressing stigma through community-based 
education, advocacy, and support networks is fundamental to 
fostering an enabling environment where individuals feel 
empowered to access and adhere to ART. Strategies to improve 
ART delivery in resource-limited settings must also contend with 
the unique demographic and epidemiological profiles of affected 
populations. In many regions, women and children bear a 
disproportionate burden of HIV/AIDS, necessitating tailored 
approaches to maternal and child health services, Prevention of 
Mother-to-Child Transmissionprograms (PMTCT), pediatric ART 
formulations. Additionally, key populations such as sex workers, 
men who have Sex With Men (MSM), and People Who Inject 
Drugs (PWID) face heightened vulnerabilities and barriers to 
accessing HIV care, requiring targeted interventions to ensure 
equitable treatment access. 

Advances in technology and innovation offer promising 
opportunities to enhance ART delivery and outcomes in 
resource-limited settings. The development of point-of-care 
diagnostics, including rapid HIV testing and viral load 
monitoring, has revolutionized clinical management by enabling 
timely initiation of treatment and early detection of treatment 
failure. Mobile Health (mHealth) technologies and telemedicine 
have expanded access to healthcare services in remote and 
underserved areas, facilitating virtual consultations, medication 
adherence support, and health education. Integration of HIV 
services with broader primary healthcare platforms is critical for 
improving treatment access and health outcomes. By embedding 
HIV testing, treatment, and care within existing maternal and 
child health, Tuberculosis (TB), and sexual reproductive health 
services, healthcare systems can streamline service delivery, 
reduce stigma, and improve continuity of care. Comprehensive 
care models that address co-morbidities such as tuberculosis, 
hepatitis B and C, and Non-Communicable Diseases (NCDs) are 
essential to optimize health outcomes among people living with 
HIV. Community engagement and empowerment play pivotal 
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reducing the burden of daily pill-taking and potentially 
improving adherence. Similarly, implantable devices and 
nanoformulations under development aim to provide sustained 
drug delivery over extended periods, further enhancing 
treatment convenience and efficacy. Despite these advancements, 
the sustainability of ART programs in resource-limited settings 
hinges on robust health governance, financing, and policy 
frameworks. Strengthening health systems, building local 
capacity through training and mentorship programs, and 
fostering South-South collaboration are essential for advancing 
ART delivery and achieving long-term HIV epidemic control. 
Multisectoral partnerships involving governments, international 
donors, academia, pharmaceutical industries, and civil society are 
indispensable for mobilizing resources, advocating for policy 
change, and scaling up evidence-based interventions.
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roles in the success of ART programs in resource-limited settings. 

Meaningful involvement of people living with HIV/AIDS 
(PLWHA), Community-Based Organizations (CBOs), and 
civil society groups is crucial for designing patient-centered 
services, advocating for policy change, and encouraging 
accountability within healthcare systems. Peer support 
networks and adherence clubs have demonstrated efficacy in 
promoting treatment adherence, retention in care, and viral 
suppression, thereby contributing to improved individual 
and public health outcomes. The emergence of long-acting 
antiretroviral formulations represents a transformative 
advancement in HIV treatment that holds considerable 
promise for resource-limited settings. Injectable ARVs such 
as cabotegravir and rilpivirine offer extended dosing intervals 
(monthly or bi-monthly) compared to daily oral medications,
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