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DESCRIPTION
Cognitive efficiency refers to the brain's ability to process 
information quickly and accurately while minimizing effort. It 
plays an important role in everyday decision-making, problem-
solving and learning. However, two factors that significantly 
disrupt cognitive efficiency are cognitive load and emotional 
interference. Both of these factors can strain mental resources, 
reducing our ability to perform tasks optimally. This article 
examine the concepts of cognitive load and emotional 
interference, how they influence cognitive efficiency and 
strategies to manage them.

Cognitive load

Cognitive load refers to the mental effort required to process 
information and perform tasks. Cognitive load theory, 
developed by psychologist John Sweller, suggests that our 
working memory has a limited capacity. When this capacity is 
exceeded, learning and performance can be impaired. When 
cognitive load is too high, individuals may experience mental 
fatigue, reduced focus and difficulty retaining information, all of 
which impair cognitive efficiency. Cognitive load can be divided 
into three types:

Intrinsic cognitive load: This is the inherent difficulty of the 
task itself. Tasks that are complex or require the integration of 
multiple concepts naturally place a higher load on working 
memory. For instance, solving complex math problems requires 
more cognitive resources than simple arithmetic.

Extraneous cognitive load: This load is caused by the way 
information is presented or structured. Poor organization or 
distracting formats can make it more difficult for individuals to 
process information. For example, a confusing diagram or 
unclear instructions can increase extraneous load and make 
learning or problem-solving less efficient.

Germane cognitive load: This refers to the mental effort 
dedicated to processing information in a way that enhances 
learning and understanding. Ideally, tasks should be designed to
 

maximize germane load while minimizing intrinsic and extraneous 
loads.

Emotional interference and its impact

Emotions also play a significant role in cognitive performance. 
Emotional interference occurs when strong emotions disrupt 
cognitive functions such as attention, memory and decision-
making. The brain's resources, already limited, are diverted 
toward managing emotional responses, leaving fewer resources 
available for cognitive tasks. For example, anxiety about an 
upcoming exam may lead to difficulty concentrating on the 
material at hand. Similarly, feelings of anger or frustration can 
impair judgment and decision-making, leading to impulsive 
actions or poor outcomes. Emotional interference can be 
particularly disruptive when the emotions are intense or chronic, 
as they can create a persistent state of cognitive overload. 
Research has shown that emotions can affect various cognitive 
processes:

Attention: Emotions can shift attention away from relevant 
information, focusing it instead on emotional triggers or 
stressors. For example, a person who is stressed may struggle to 
focus on a work task, constantly distracted by thoughts of the 
stressor.

Memory: Emotional states can influence the encoding and 
retrieval of memories. For instance, strong emotions like fear or 
happiness can enhance the recall of emotionally charged events, 
but they can also interfere with the recall of neutral or less 
significant information.

Decision-making: Emotions can cloud judgment, leading 
individuals to make impulsive or irrational decisions. Anxiety 
might cause someone to avoid making decisions, while anger 
could lead to speed, poorly thought-out choices.

Interaction between cognitive load and emotional 
interference

Cognitive load and emotional interference are often 
intertwined, with each influencing the other. High cognitive 
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load can exacerbate emotional responses, as the brain has fewer 
resources available to regulate emotions. Conversely, intense 
emotions can increase cognitive load by making it harder to 
focus on tasks or process information. For example, an 
individual working under tight deadlines may experience both 
high cognitive load and stress. The cognitive demand of 
managing multiple tasks might trigger anxiety or anger, which in 
turn increases cognitive load, creating a cycle of escalating 
inefficiency.

CONCLUSION
Cognitive load and emotional interference are two critical 
factors that can disrupt cognitive efficiency. High cognitive load

can overwhelm the brain’s processing capacity, while emotional
interference diverts mental resources away from cognitive tasks.
Understanding these factors and implementing strategies to
manage them can enhance cognitive performance, reduce
mental fatigue and improve overall efficiency. By simplifying
tasks, managing stress and staying organized, individuals can
protect their cognitive resources and perform at their best in
various aspects of life.
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